

Sumner County Board of Education

Scott Langford, Ed. D.

Director of Schools

695 East Main Street Gallatin, TN 37066-2472

Phone: (615) 451-5200 Fax: (615) 451-5216

Board of Education Members

Sarah Andrews Tim Brewer Andy Daniels Josh Graham Glen Gregory Betsy Hawkins Tammy Hayes Steven King Andy Lacy Allen Lancaster Ted Wise

Seating Capacity	\$43,660.00 1,482	\$43,365.00 1,472	\$216,480.00 1,744
Seating Capacity	\$16,615.00 564	\$16,969.00 576	\$74,400.00 572
	0	0	\$53,590.00
Seating Capacity	NO BID	NO BID	\$189,760.00 1,348
Seating Capacity	NO BID	NO BID	\$76,720.00 572
Misc. Additional Fees - Elevated	NO BID	NO BID	\$59,440.00
Misc. Additional Fees	\$16,615.00 0	\$16,969.00 0	\$108,375.00 \$27,640.00
Seating Capacity	564	576	528
Misc. Additional Fees	NO BID 0	NO BID 0	\$88,560.00 \$24,610.00
Seating Capacity	564	576	408